
BID TABULATION 
 

BID NO. 2017-N 
 

ULV APPROVED ADULTICIDE 
 
 
Date of Bid: 5/2/2017 11:00AM 
 
 
Ready to Use Permethrin / P.B.O. based ULV Approved Adulticide 
Minimum 3.5% Permethrin 
And/Or Alternate water based Permethrin product and provide mixing station 
 
COMPANY NAME   BID AMOUNTS  

        
ADAPCO, Inc.  PBO Based 2x2.5gal/cs $16.76/gal Water Based 4x1gal/cs $135.00/gal   
      55 gal drum $14.96/gal   30 gal/drum $125.00/gal 
      275 gal/tote $14.38/gal   275 gal/tote $no bid 
 
UNIVAR USA, Inc.  PBO Based 2x2.5gal/cs $15.44/gal Water Based 4x1gal/cs $no bid    
      30 gal/drum $15.02/gal   30 gal/drum $96.00/gal 
      55 gal drum $15.02/gal   275 gal/tote $no bid 
      275 gal/tote $15.02/gal 
 
ALLPRO VECTOR GROUP PBO Based 2x2.5gal/cs $15.75/gal Water Based 4x1gal/cs $no bid   
      30 gal/drum $15.75/gal   2x2.5 gal/cs $118.00/gal 
      55 gal drum $15.24/gal   30 gal/drum $118.00/gal    
      275 gal/tote $15.24/gal   55 gal/drum $118.00/gal 
            275 gal/tote $118.00/gal 
   
  

 


